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Weather

TODAY:
SUNNY

HIGH OF 26
LOW OF 12

TUESDAY:
SUNNY

HIGH OF 28
LOW OF 10

WEDNESDAY:
SUNNY

HIGH OF 29
LOW OF 15

THURSDAY:
MIX OF SUN
AND CLOUDS

HIGH OF 31
LOW OF 17

FRIDAY:
60% CHANCE
OF SHOWERS

HIGH OF 26
LOW OF 13
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Volunteer centre welcomes 
summer student

T
he Missisquoi North Volunteer Cen-
tre (CABMN) is proud to welcome
Summer Student, Selena Chapman

to its staff for the summer months.
Though a Summer Student Grant made
possible by the Federal Government, the
CABMN is able to have an extra pair of
hands while adding a vivacious person-
ality with a beautiful smile to the team.
Selena is a Bolton-Est resident and both
of her parents took part in the CABMN
youth programs many years ago.

The CABMN is a busy place during the
summer months and many of the staff
takes their vacations during this time.
Having a summer student, while there is
much to learn, allows others to get a
well deserved break while assuring that
the CABMN is open and able to provide
regular services and programs.

Selena will assume reception duties
working alongside reception volunteers
and staff members.  She is keen on the
computer and although there are many
things to learn, Selena will acquire the
knowledge as she goes; learning, grow-
ing and gaining experience with each
new day.  She aspires to be an actress one
day and while coming across as being a
little shy, she is mature and extremely
eager to learn.

Selena is pictured here preparing do-

nation letters to mail out as the CABMN
launches its Annual Financial Cam-
paign.  This particular day she was as-
sisted by some youth volunteers, Kate
Eldridge, Jasmine Mierzwinski and
Danika Robinson.  Resembling “Charlie’s
Angels,” the four filled envelopes,
searched for addresses, stamped and
made multiple trips to the post office;
stopping for a well deserved slush bever-
age on the way in hopes of beating the
heat.

Summer students acquire skills and

work experience through these vital
grants and aid organizations immensely.
The CABMN is proud to be a recipient of
a grant this year and as the youth come
in to volunteer, year round, it is clear
that summer student applicants will be
plentiful for many years to come.  Please
stop by the CABMN and say hello to Se-
lena, she looks forward to meeting new
people everyday.

For information about the CABMN
Volunteer Centre visit:  www.cabmn.org

Mable Hastings

The Scoop
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Selena Chapman (3rd girl in middle) and CAB youth volunteers
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